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“It was exciting to touch my own body (in first-
person perspective mode) while creating the 
avatar, and it was also interesting to see and 
touch myself from the outside (in third-person 
perspective mode).
“I liked the fact that I could see how my avatar 
would actually look in virtual spaces when I was 
creating it.” 
“I think it’s good that I can customize my avatar 
with intuitive operations, and that I can switch 
perspectives.” 
“It was great to be able to adjust the subtle length 
of the hair on the front and sides while looking in 
the mirror (from a first-person perspective). It 
was also nice to be able to adjust the length of the 
back hair by looking at it from behind (from a 
third-person perspective). It would be interesting 
to be able to change not only the length and 
parting of the hair, but also the degree of wave of 
the hair.” 

“It was difficult to understand the range of each 
changeable arrow (guide object) on the sleeves, 
and it became a mess.” 
“In this system, we touch wedges (guide objects) 
to change the shape of clothes and the length of 
hair, but I thought it would be better if we could 
touch clothes and hair (directly) instead of 
wedges, just as we usually touch them.” 
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